
 
Mastery Still Practicing Still Practicing Still Practicing 

Focus 
20 points: Digital narrative 
tells a story about an aspect of 
the student’s identity 

10 points: Student tells a story 
about themselves, but is not 
necessarily about their identity 

0 Points: Student tells a story 

 

Storyline 

20 points: The digital narrative 
has all of the requirements: 

• An engaging opening to their 
story 

• A clear plot structure 
(exposition, rising action, 
climax, falling action, and 
resolution) 

• An ending that reflects on 
why the story is told 

15 points: Student meets two 
of the requirements. 

10 points: Student meets one 
of the requirements. 

0 points: The digital narrative 
is missing the required 
components. 

Writer's 
Moves 

30 points: The digital narrative 
has all of the requirements: 

• Student’s narrative shows 
the story, rather than just 
“telling” it to listeners. 

• Student uses five or more 
writer’s moves. 

• Student creates an 
intentional tone for their 
digital narrative (either 
through word choice, 
images, background music, 
etc…) (e.g., happy, serious, 
silly, scary, etc…) 

23 points: Student meets two 

of the requirements. 

19 points: Student meets one 

of the requirements. 

0 points: The digital narrative 

is missing the required 
components. 

Technology 

30 points: The digital narrative 
has all of the requirements: 

• Student creatively uses 
digital technology to publish 
their narrative. 

• Student’s voice can be 
clearly heard and 
understood in all audio 
components. 

• Visual and audio 
components enhance the 
story, rather than distract 
from it. 

23 points: Student meets two 

of the requirements. 

19 points: Student meets one 

of the requirements. 

0 points: The digital narrative 

is missing the required 
components. 



 


